
Idaho State Bar 
 

Environment and Natural Resources Section 

Meeting Agenda -Amended 3/24/2025 

March 26th, 2025  

VIA ZOOM  

1. Introduction and Welcome (Riker)  
 

2. Treasurer’s Report (Boquist) 
 

3. Brief announcements (all) 
 

4. CLE Presentation: NEPA’s Rapidly Changing Landscape 

Presenter: Stacey Bosshardt 
Stacey Bosshardt represents mining, transmission, renewable energy, real estate, and other business and 
governmental clients in environmental and natural resources litigation throughout the country. Stacey's 
substantial experience includes positions as assistant section chief and senior trial attorney in the Natural 
Resources Section of the U.S. Department of Justice (DOJ), Environment and Natural Resources Division, 
where she litigated and supervised dozens of cases brought in U.S. district courts. Her experience with 
cases involving public lands includes litigation under the National Environmental Policy Act, Endangered 
Species Act, National Historic Preservation Act, Clean Water Act, Federal Lands Policy Management Act, 
Mineral Leasing Act, National Forest Management Act, and Administrative Procedure Act.  
 
In her positions at DOJ, Stacey supervised a team of 10 trial attorneys representing the federal government 
in lawsuits related to its management of public lands and natural resources. She was selected as lead 
attorney to defend federal agency high-profile decisions in U.S. district courts, including loan guarantees, 
proposed land management decisions, and rights of way and special use permits for renewable energy 
facilities, transmission line upgrades, a groundwater development project, and cleanup of contaminated 
sites. Her client agencies in those challenges to federal approvals included the Bureau of Land 
Management, Bureau of Indian Affairs, U.S. National Park Service U.S. Department of Transportation 
(DOT), U.S. Forest Service, U.S. Export-Import Bank, U.S. Department of Energy, U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers, U.S. Department of Homeland Security, U.S. General Services Administration and U.S. Fish 
and Wildlife Service. Stacey has also worked either as trial counsel or supervisor on the defense of 
challenges to multiple DOT-funded projects, including highways, interchanges, trail conversions, bridges, 
light rail, high-speed rail, and bus rapid transit projects.  
 
Stacey served as ethics advisor to the White House Counsel's office during the Obama administration. She 
was also recruited as counsel to the U.S. Senate Committee on Homeland Security & Governmental 
Affairs' special investigation into the government's response to Hurricane Katrina, which focused on the 
intersection of climate-driven events and disaster preparedness. 
 

NEXT MONTHLY LUNCH MEETING April 23, 2025 
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